
Amon Carter Jr. 
Reported Safe, I 

Freed by Reds 
EAST OF THE ELBE WITH 

THE ~RUSSIAN ARMIES, May 2 
(JP). - Three released American 
prisoners of war from Lucken­
walde reported Wednesday that 
Amon G. Carter .Tr., son of the 
Fort Worth publisher, was alive 
and well and had been liberated 
by the Russian advance. 

"Carter was in charge of dis­
tributing Red Cross parcels and 
when I saw him last yesterday he 
was in good shape and was staying 
in the Luckenwalde camp in com­
pliance with the senior American 
officer's order that prisoners stay 
there until arrangements are made 
for them," said Lt. Henry N. Crel­
lin , Springfield, Oh10. 

Crellin reached American lines 
with Lt. Robert H. Harvel of Chi­
cago and Lt. Lewis L. Dalofie of 
Natrona Heights, Pa. 

Crellin was captured in Metz 
last October from the 5th Division. 
Harvey, a Flying Fortress navi­
gator, was shot down over Berlin 
last June. And Dalofie was cap­
tured from the 103rd Division in 
December. 


